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® Post Office Box 830719

Birmingham, Alabama 35283-0719
BURR eee FORMAN wr e Off?cea:r?;osnsmooo
4 Fax: (205) 458-5100
BURR.COM

resulls matier
RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 10 Sep 2015
ATTN: SANDY ORAM Invoice # 877270
3434 COLWELL AVENUE, STE 200 Bill Atty: SIS
TAMPA, FL 33614 As of 08/31/15

EMPLOYER 1.D. #63-0322727

0026855 RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DISTRICT
0000003 Construction Matters

BILL SUMMARY THROUGH AUGUST 31, 2015

Professional Services ' $6,716.50
Disbursements 354.90
TOTAL DUE THIS BILL $7,071.40
Previous Balance Due $6,073.00
TOTAL BALANCE DUE . $13,144.40
RECEIVED
StF 17 2065

REMITTANCE COPY

PLEASE INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT
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RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 10 Sep 2015
ATTN: SANDY ORAM Invoice # 877270
3434 COLWELL AVENUE, STE 200 Bill Atty: SIS
TAMPA, FL 33614 As of 08/31/15

EMPLOYER 1.D. #63-0322727

0026855 RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DISTRICT
0000003 Construction Matters

Date Description Atty Hours Value

08/07/15 Review plats to prepare legal description; JR 1.30 $221.00
correspondence to Sean Ware requesting
itemized lists of lots sold

08/10/15 Review correspondence from Sean Ware; JR 1.00 $170.00
review and revise legal description for
CDD and Declaration documents

08/11/15 Review plats and prepare legal description JR 2.20 $374.00
of lots
08/12/15 Email to team outlining final acquisition SIS 1.00 $325.00

issues: revise and send Bill of Sale form to
Jamie; email with certificate to Kyle
Thornton.

08/14/15 Email from Gary regarding K&G contract; SIS 0.80 $260.00
email Rizzetta to add acceptance items to
agenda; forward K&G contract to Mike P.
filled out.

08/17/15 Email Jamie form Bill of Sale; calls to SIS 2.80 $910.00
Jamie to coordinate on final paperwork for
acquisition of rec center; draft memo to
Board outlining documents and proposing
materials; email memo to Jamie; call to
architect.

08/18/15 Call with Jamie Scarola to confirm SIS 0.50 $162.50
certificate; email to architect for status of
his review; revise memo to Board
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Date Description Atty Hours Value

regarding acquisition.

08/19/15 Draft a resolution to be approved at SIS 2.00 $650.00
tomorrow's meeting outlining documents
and requirements for acquisition; draft up
an email explaining game plan and forward
document to Jamie and Sean; email Jamie
engineer's certificate.

08/21/15 Email Jamie and others status of SIS 2.50 $812.50
inspection; email Bill of Sale to Mike
Southward; email proposal to Mike
Piendel; calls to Jamie, Sean Ware and
Mike Piendel; conference call with Sean
and Rizzetta's office to coordinate on
Requisition to Trustee; email architect for

inspection.
08/21/15 Prepare and e-record documents in JR 0.60 $102.00
Hillsborough County
08/21/15 Review confirmation of recording and JR 0.60 $102.00
calendar file for receipt of original recorded
documents
08/24/15 Emails with Jamie, architect and Mike. SIS 0.30 $97.50
08/24/15 Prepare and record quitclaim deeds for JR 1.00 $170.00

parcels to be conveyed to CDD in Phase
1A and Phase 1B

08/25/15 Receive recorded quitclaim deeds and JR 0.50 $85.00
transmit o client
08/26/15 Forward JAH report to Jamie and Michael, SIS 2.00 $650.00

call with Jamie to discuss his concerns;
draft a proposed letter to receiver from
Beazer to address needed corrections; call
from Jamie to add language; email letter to
Michael; emails and calls with Jamie, Mike
and Rizzetta.

08/27/15 Briefly review report from JAH; forward to SIS 3.00 $975.00
team; email with Mike Piendel and Kaitlyn
at Rizzetta; call with Jamie Scarola to
discuss report and how to deal with it;
forward demand to Kaitlyn; review draft
letter and forward to Mike Southward; calls
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Date Description Atty Hours Value
with Jamie, Piendel and Kaitlyn.
08/28/15 Email response to Mike Southward's SIS 1.50 $487.50
questions; emails and follow-up calls to
Jamie, Rizzetta's office, Mike Piendel and
Sein.
08/31/15 Email to Rizzetta regarding final payment; SIS 0.50 $162.50
organize exhibits to Resolution 2015-14
and forward to District's office for final
record.
Total Services 24.10 $6,716.50
Date Disbursements Value
08/19/15 Recording Fees — VENDOR: Simplifile LC; 316.50
INVOICE#: 081915; DATE: 8/19/2015 - E-
Recording Fees for Four Documents on Simplifile
Account
08/24/15 Recording Fees — VENDOR: Hillsborough County 38.40
Clerk of Circuit Cou; INVOICE#: 082415; DATE:
8/24/2015 - J. Nielsen / Recording Fees for 2
Quitclaim Deeds from Developer to CDD for
Maintained Parcels on Plat
Total Disbursements $354.90
Total Services and Disbursements $7,071.40
Previous Balance Due $6,073.00
TOTAL NOW DUE $13,144.40
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SUMMARY OF SERVICES

Name Rank Rate Hours Amount
Scott Steady Partner $325.00 16.90 $5,492.50
Judithe A. Richards Paralegal $170.00 7.20 $1,224.00
TOTALS 24.10 $6,716.50



® Post Office Box 830719

Birmingham, Alabama 35283-0719

B U R R LA FO R M A N LLP Office: (205) 251-3000
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results matter

RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 16 Oct 2015
ATTN: SANDY ORAM Invoice # 882818
3434 COLWELL AVENUE, STE 200 Bill Atty: SIS
TAMPA, FL 33614 As of 09/30/15

EMPLOYER LD, #63-0322727

0026855 RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DISTRICT
0000003 Construction Matters

BILL SUMMARY THROUGH SEPTEMBER 30, 2015

Professional Services $455.00
TOTAL DUE THIS BILL $455.00
Previous Balance Due $7,071.40
TOTAL BALANCE DUE $7,526.40

REMITTANCE COPY

PLEASE INCLUDE THIS PAGE WITH YOUR PAYMENT
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RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT 16 Oct 2015
ATTN: SANDY ORAM Invoice # 882818
3434 COLWELL AVENUE, STE 200 Bill Atty: SIS
TAMPA, FL 33614 As of 09/30/15
EMPLOYER 1.D. #63-0322727
0026855 RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DISTRICT
0000003 Construction Matters
Date Description Atty Hours Value
09/03/15 Utilizing the Long Lake Ranch form, draft a SIS 1.40 $455.00
resolution for the O&M as requested by
Rizzetta; forward draft to Greg Cox; follow-
up emails with Greg regarding resolution
and Bill of Sale for rec center.
Total Services 1.40 $455.00
Total Services and Disbursements $455.00
Previous Balance Due $7,071.40
TOTAL NOW DUE $7,526.40
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SUMMARY OF SERVICES
Name Rank Rate Hours Amount
Scott Steady Partner $325.00 1.40 $455.00
TOTALS 1.40 $455.00
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December 28, 2015

To Whom It May Concern:
I, Michael Piendel, hereby submit my resignation from the Reserve at Pradera Community
Development District Board of Supervisors effective January 1, 2016.

//?& (/ 2L /%/z8//8"

Michael Piendel, Chairman




Tab 5



RESERVE AT PRADERA
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
BOARD OF SUPERVISOR
OATH OF OFFICE

l, , A CITIZEN OF THE STATE OF FLORIDA AND OF THE
UNITED STATES OF AMERICA AND BEING EMPLOYED BY OR AN OFFICER OF
RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT AND ARECIPIENT OF
PUBLIC FUNDS AS SUCH EMPLOYEE OR OFFICER, DO HEREBY SOLEMNLY SWEAR OR
AFFIRM THAT 1 WILL SUPPORT THE CONSTITUTION OF THE UNITED STATES AND
THE STATE OF FLORIDA.

Signature

ACKNOWLEDGMENT OF OATH BEING TAKEN

STATE OF FLORIDA
COUNTY OF HILLSBOROUGH

On this __ day of , 201, before me, personally appeared
to me well known and known to me to be the person described in
and who took the aforementioned oath as a Board Member of the Board of Supervisors of the
Reserve at Pradera Community Development District and acknowledged to and before me that they
took said oath for the purposes therein expressed.

WITNESS my hand and official seal the date aforesaid.

Printed:

Notary Public
STATE OF FLORIDA

My commission expires on:
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RESOLUTION 2016-01

A RESOLUTION OF THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS OF RESERVE AT
PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT
REDESIGNATING THE OFFICERS OF THE DISTRICT, AND
PROVIDING FOR AN EFFECTIVE DATE

WHEREAS, Reserve at Pradera Community Development District (hereinafter the
“District”) is a local unit of special-purpose government created and existing pursuant to Chapter
190, Florida Statutes, being situated entirely within Hillsborough County, Florida; and

WHEREAS, the Board of Supervisors of the District desires to designate the Officers of
the District.

NOW, THEREFORE, BE IT RESOLVED BY THE BOARD OF SUPERVISORS
OF RESERVE AT PRADERA COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT DISTRICT:

Section 1. is appointed Chairman.
Section 2. is appointed Vice Chairman.
Section 3. is appointed Assistant Secretary.

Is appointed Assistant Secretary.
is appointed Assistant Secretary.
Is appointed Assistant Secretary.
is appointed Assistant Secretary.

Section 4. This Resolution shall become effective immediately upon its adoption.
PASSED AND ADOPTED THIS 21ST DAY OF JANUARY, 2016.

RESERVE AT PRADERA
COMMUNITY DEVELOPMENT
DISTRICT

CHAIRMAN/VICE CHAIRMAN

ATTEST:

SECRETARY/ASST. SECRETARY
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